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The theory of probability is a powerful tool that helps electrical and computer engineers to explain, model,
analyze, and design the technology they develop. The text begins at the advanced undergraduate level,
assuming only a modest knowledge of probability, and progresses through more complex topics mastered at
graduate level. The first five chapters cover the basics of probability and both discrete and continuous
random variables. The later chapters have a more specialized coverage, including random vectors, Gaussian
random vectors, random processes, Markov Chains, and convergence. Describing tools and results that are
used extensively in the field, this is more than a textbook; it is also a reference for researchers working in
communications, signal processing, and computer network traffic analysis. With over 300 worked examples,
some 800 homework problems, and sections for exam preparation, this is an essential companion for
advanced undergraduate and graduate students. Further resources for this title, including solutions (for
instructors only), are available online at www.cambridge.org/9780521864701.
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From reader reviews:

Diana Castillo:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice simply by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading. Sure,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading a new book, we give you this specific Probability and Random Processes
for Electrical and Computer Engineers book as nice and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is
more than just a book.

Shalon Dougherty:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This Probability and Random Processes for Electrical and Computer Engineers
book is readable by simply you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for
enjoyable reading through experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to provide
to you. The writer connected with Probability and Random Processes for Electrical and Computer Engineers
content conveys thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
content but it just different such as it. So , do you even now thinking Probability and Random Processes for
Electrical and Computer Engineers is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Rodolfo Buker:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Probability and Random Processes
for Electrical and Computer Engineers which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
view.

Ronald Peyton:

You may get this Probability and Random Processes for Electrical and Computer Engineers by visit the
bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties
for the knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by written or printed but in addition can you
enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking of your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your e-
book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to
choose right ways for you.
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