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A celebration of fathers and fatherhood, this one-of-a-kind anthology features the richly varied voices of
daughters and sons, and of fathers and grandfathers themselves.

From eleventh-century Chinese poet Su Tung-p'o's witty "On the Birth of His Son" to Dylan Thomas's
poignant "Do Not Go Gentle into That Good Night," from Sylvia Plath's searing poem "Daddy" to Yeats's
tender "A Prayer for My Daughter," from Homer to Seamus Heaney, from Shakespeare to Milosz, the poets
and poems collected here range across cultures and centuries and speak to birth, death, and all the facets of
the father-child relationship. Gratitude, tenderness, and awe infuse some of the poems. Others express anger
or sorrow. Many are moving tributes to the first man in a child's life. And each one conveys the profound
nature of fatherhood.
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From reader reviews:

Debbie Davis:

Book is definitely written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by
a e-book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Fatherhood: poems about fathers
(Everyman's Library Pocket Poets) will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel a lot more
confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think that open or reading a new book
make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you trying to find best
book or ideal book with you?

Juanita Hernandez:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled Fatherhood: poems about fathers (Everyman's Library Pocket Poets) your mind will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your
mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become one type conclusion and
explanation this maybe you never get ahead of. The Fatherhood: poems about fathers (Everyman's Library
Pocket Poets) giving you one more experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful
facts for your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern at this point is
your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a. Do you want to
try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Cleta Blackwell:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you go
through a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds
of us novel, comics, along with soon. The Fatherhood: poems about fathers (Everyman's Library Pocket
Poets) will give you a new experience in reading a book.

Jeff Brown:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes studying, not only science book and also novel and Fatherhood: poems about fathers (Everyman's
Library Pocket Poets) or perhaps others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly
amazing a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or
students especially. Those books are helping them to include their knowledge. In different case, beside



science publication, any other book likes Fatherhood: poems about fathers (Everyman's Library Pocket
Poets) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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