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The ultimate post-breakup bible for women. This smart, sassy, and visually fun book will inspire women to
take charge of their lives, get over their exes, and get off their asses and have fun! The book includes the
authors' own personal stories, told with irreverent humor, as well as advice from other women who've been
dumped, and lots of empowering (and humorous) quotations. And if that isn't enough, the book is filled with
practical recommendations on where to go and what to do to get your life back on track.

Praise for DUMPED:  "Big laughs and big fun." -- Rory Freedman, coauthor of Skinny Bitch, # 1 New
York Times Best Seller

"A kick-ass book about picking your ass up when you're down...These gals are the best coaches and best
friends that you need." -- Jill Conner Browne, author of Sweet Potato Queens' Book of Love, # 1 New York
Times Best Seller

."DUMPED is a hilarious, irreverent,and empowering (but not in a gross way) guide to getting over the guy
and getting a life. You will laugh, nod, and finally delete that jerk from your contacts." -- Amy Sohn,
columnist, New York Magazine and New York Post, and author, Sex and the City: Kiss and Tell, New York
Times Best Seller

"...After reading DUMPED, you'll wish you were dumped yourself just so you can join their gang of self-
empowered babes."-- Lewis Schiff, coauthor of The Middle-Class Millionaire Read

"Maryjane Fahey & Caryn Beth Rosenthal's funny yet spot-on practical guide to getting over the jerk." --
Tracey Jackson, author of Between a Rock and a Hot Place and screenwriter of Confessions of a Shopaholic

"Far better company than your good-for-nothing ex." --Michael Hogan, Executive Entertainment Editor, The
Huffington Post
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From reader reviews:

Lela Koehn:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled Dumped: A Guide to Getting Over a Breakup and Your Ex in Record
Time!. Try to face the book Dumped: A Guide to Getting Over a Breakup and Your Ex in Record Time! as
your close friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you experience alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book
makes you far more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new
experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Alma Driver:

Exactly why? Because this Dumped: A Guide to Getting Over a Breakup and Your Ex in Record Time! is an
unordinary book that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the
secret it inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such incredible
way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely.
So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This
phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book include such as help improving your
skill and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were you I will go
to the reserve store hurriedly.

Jonathan Ouzts:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Dumped: A Guide to Getting Over a
Breakup and Your Ex in Record Time! book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make
book that could be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written throughout good manner for you,
still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still
hesitation Dumped: A Guide to Getting Over a Breakup and Your Ex in Record Time! as good book not
merely by the cover but also from the content. This is one book that can break don't assess book by its deal
with, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your studying sixth
sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Reta Zimmer:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find e-book that need more time
to be study. Dumped: A Guide to Getting Over a Breakup and Your Ex in Record Time! can be your answer
given it can be read by an individual who have those short spare time problems.
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