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In Mexico, the poinsettia is called flor de la Nochebuenao flower of the Holy Night. At Christmastime, the
flower blooms and flourishes, the quite exquisite red stars lighting up the countryside.

This Mexican legend tells how the poinsettia came to be, through a little girl's unselfish gift to the Christ
Child. Beloved Newbery honor-winning author and Caldecott honor-winning illustrator Tomie dePaola has
embraced the legend using his own special feeling for Christmas. His glorious paintings capture not only the
brilliant colors of Mexico and its art, but also the excitement of the children preparing for Christmas and the
hope of Lucida, who comes to see what makes a gift truly beautiful.
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From reader reviews:

Vickie Reed:

The ability that you get from The Legend of the Poinsettia is a more deep you excavating the information
that hide inside the words the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
know but The Legend of the Poinsettia giving you joy feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood by anyone who read this because the author of this e-book is well-
known enough. This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to
understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for
having this kind of The Legend of the Poinsettia instantly.

Beverly Barber:

The actual book The Legend of the Poinsettia will bring someone to the new experience of reading the book.
The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to see, this book
very suited to you. The book The Legend of the Poinsettia is much recommended to you to study. You can
also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Martin Song:

The particular book The Legend of the Poinsettia has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read this book
you can get a lot of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. This articles author
makes some research ahead of write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point
easily after looking over this book.

Ora Orozco:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in
e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of The Legend of the Poinsettia can give you a lot of
pals because by you checking out this one book you have thing that they don't and make you more like an
interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you
information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than various other make you to be
great persons. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Legend of the Poinsettia.
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