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Fundamentals of Cost Accounting provides a direct, realistic, and efficient way to learn cost accounting,
integrated with new technology learning tools. Fundamentals is short (approximately 700 pages), making it
easy to cover in one semester. The authors have kept the text concise by focusing on the key concepts
students need to master. The Decision opening vignettes and Business Application boxes show realistic
applications of these concepts throughout. All chapters conclude with a Debrief that links the topics in the
chapter to the decision problem faced by the manager in the opening vignette. Comprehensive end-of-chapter
material provides students with all the practice they need to fully learn each concept.

McGraw-Hill Connect Accounting provides students every advantage as they strive to understand the key
concepts of cost accounting and its role in business. Connect Accounting offers a complete digital solution
with a robust online learning and homework management system, an integrated media-rich eBook,
assignable end-of-chapter material, algorithmic functionality, and reporting capabilities.

Contained within Connect Accounting is McGraw-Hill’s adaptive learning system, LearnSmart, which is
designed to help students learn faster, study more efficiently, and retain more knowledge for greater success.
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From reader reviews:

Yasmin Parker:

Here thing why this specific Fundamentals of Cost Accounting with Connect are different and trustworthy to
be yours. First of all reading through a book is good however it depends in the content of computer which is
the content is as scrumptious as food or not. Fundamentals of Cost Accounting with Connect giving you
information deeper as different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no guide that similar with
Fundamentals of Cost Accounting with Connect. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your
own eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You
can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your approach home by train. If you are having difficulties
in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Fundamentals of Cost Accounting with Connect in e-book can
be your option.

Salvador Perez:

This Fundamentals of Cost Accounting with Connect is completely new way for you who has attention to
look for some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more
you know or perhaps you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Fundamentals of Cost
Accounting with Connect can be the light food in your case because the information inside this particular
book is easy to get by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, that's
why I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel drowsy even
dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is not any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find
actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book type for your better
life and knowledge.

Krystal Wilson:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our expertise for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year was exactly
added. This reserve Fundamentals of Cost Accounting with Connect was filled with regards to science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has several
feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a book. In
the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Lorenza Jones:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news.
On this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your



book? Or just trying to find the Fundamentals of Cost Accounting with Connect when you essential it?
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