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In a surprising number of espionage cases sex has played a significant role?often only in the
background?possibly as a reason why a particular individual has lived beyond his means and is in desperate
need of cash. FBI agent Earl Pitts sold secrets to the Soviets to ease his financial burdens, which came from
his habitually heavy use of male and female prostitutes. Yuri Nosenko collaborated with the CIA after
having misappropriated KGB funds to entertain expensive women while on official duties in Geneva, and
Aleksandr Ogorodnik of the Soviet foreign ministry was persuaded to become a spy by his pregnant Spanish
lover, an agent recruited by the CIA.

In the realm of human behavior, sex can be the catalyst for risky or reckless conduct. The A to Z of
Sexspionage explores this behavior through a chronology, an introduction, a bibliography, and hundreds of
cross-referenced dictionary entries on the secret agencies, operations, and events. From Delilah's seduction
of Samson in 1161 BC to State Department official Donald Keyser's conviction of passing secrets to Isabelle
Cheng, a Taiwanese intelligence officer, in 2007, Nigel West recounts the history of sexspionage.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Chapman:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As we know that book is
very important for people. The book The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide Series) seemed to be
making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The book The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide Series) is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also to get your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your
current spend time to read your publication. Try to make relationship using the book The A to Z of
Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide Series). You never really feel lose out for everything in case you read some
books.

Gayle Skinner:

This The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide Series) book is not really ordinary book, you have it then
the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is information inside this publication
incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. That
The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide Series) without we realize teach the one who examining it
become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being worry The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z
Guide Series) can bring whenever you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it in the lovely laptop even phone. This The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide
Series) having fine arrangement in word and layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Gene Taylor:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want
to test look for book, may be the e-book untitled The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide Series) can
be good book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Dennis Utley:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find book that need
more time to be study. The A to Z of Sexspionage (The A to Z Guide Series) can be your answer since it can
be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.
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