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American myths about national character tend to overshadow the historical realities. Mr. Horsman's book is
the first study to examine the origins of racialism in America and to show that the belief in white American
superiority was firmly ensconced in the nation's ideology by 1850.

The author deftly chronicles the beginnings and growth of an ideology stressing race, basic stock, and
attributes in the blood. He traces how this ideology shifted from the more benign views of the Founding
Fathers, which embraced ideas of progress and the spread of republican institutions for all. He finds linkages
between the new, racialist ideology in America and the rising European ideas of Anglo-Saxon, Teutonic, and
scientific ideologies of the early nineteenth century. Most importantly, however, Horsman demonstrates that
it was the merging of the Anglo-Saxon rhetoric with the experience of Americans conquering a continent
that created a racialist philosophy. Two generations before the "new" immigrants began arriving in the late
nineteenth century, Americans, in contact with blacks, Indians, and Mexicans, became vociferous racialists.

In sum, even before the Civil War, Americans had decided that peoples of large parts of this continent were
incapable of creating or sharing in efficient, prosperous, democratic governments, and that American Anglo-
Saxons could achieve unprecedented prosperity and power by the outward thrust of their racialism and
commercial penetration of other lands. The comparatively benevolent view of the Founders of the Republic
had turned into the quite malevolent ideology that other peoples could not be "regenerated" through the
spread of free institutions.
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From reader reviews:

Karen Imes:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people
in the world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great and important the book Race and Manifest Destiny: Origins of American
Racial Anglo-Saxonism. All type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet
methods or other social media.

Allison Devore:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try issue that really opposite from
that. One particular activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition details. Even you love Race and Manifest Destiny: Origins of American Racial
Anglo-Saxonism, it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind
of hang type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its referred to
as reading friends.

Deborah Hagan:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This guide Race and Manifest Destiny: Origins of American Racial
Anglo-Saxonism was filled with regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your
science competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit
from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book
that you wanted.

Katherine Holt:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library
or even make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart
or real their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
at this time there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading through is not important,
boring and also can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important
for you. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says,
many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Race and Manifest Destiny: Origins of American
Racial Anglo-Saxonism can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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