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This historic book may have numerous typos and missing text. Purchasers can usually download a free
scanned copy of the original book (without typos) from the publisher. Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1896
edition. Excerpt: ...sent to Brunswick, where he received a regular classical course of schoolin. At college
Dr. Brandes was a diligent student an was graduated in the re ular classical course, or rather in the literary
and m ical course at Gottin en University, Hanover, in 1843. He then enteredt e government service, where
he engaged in the practice of medicine for eighteen months, which fully fitted him for his profession.
Frederick Brandes, the father of Charles, was left an ample fortune by his father, Anton Brandes, who settled
in Hanover and s ent his later life there, and was a friend of the Duke of runswick. In 1845 Dr. Brandes'
ambition led him to cross the ocean and seek success in the new world. On reaching America he came to
Pennsylvania, and finall settled in Erie, where he has spent the most of his li e since in the practice of his
profession. As a physician and surgeon Dr. Brandes has won a high reputation. Though havin a very large
practice that so fully occupied his time, e has taken time to travel extensively, and has visited almost all the
civilized countries in the world, and almost every State in the Union. In 1849, during the gold excitement, he
went to Califomia, where he engaged in washing gold for two weeks onl, though he remained in California
for eighteen mont s, the most of that time in the agreeable companionship of Gen. john A. Suiter, meantime
practicing medicine. He retumed to Erie in 1850 and renewed the practice of his profession. In 1854, during
the Crimean war, he visited Europe. The tri was taken for his health, which was greatly benefit. Before his
return he made a last visit to his mother in Hanover. In 1855 he returned to Erie, and has since been actively
and successfully engaged in the practice of his profession. He...
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From reader reviews:

Heidi Odom:

The feeling that you get from Nelson's Biographical Dictionary and Historical Reference Book of Erie
County, Pennsylvania; Containing a Condensed History of Pennsylvania, of Erie ... and Townships in the
County Also Portraits will be the more deep you digging the information that hide into the words the more
you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but Nelson's
Biographical Dictionary and Historical Reference Book of Erie County, Pennsylvania; Containing a
Condensed History of Pennsylvania, of Erie ... and Townships in the County Also Portraits giving you joy
feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in particular way that can be understood by simply
anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. That book also makes your
own vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We highly recommend you for having that Nelson's Biographical Dictionary and Historical
Reference Book of Erie County, Pennsylvania; Containing a Condensed History of Pennsylvania, of Erie ...
and Townships in the County Also Portraits instantly.

Clarence Jenkins:

The publication with title Nelson's Biographical Dictionary and Historical Reference Book of Erie County,
Pennsylvania; Containing a Condensed History of Pennsylvania, of Erie ... and Townships in the County
Also Portraits posesses a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of advantage after read
this book. This particular book exist new information the information that exist in this guide represented the
condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world.
This book will bring you throughout new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book with your smart
phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Regina Schubert:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Nelson's Biographical
Dictionary and Historical Reference Book of Erie County, Pennsylvania; Containing a Condensed History of
Pennsylvania, of Erie ... and Townships in the County Also Portraits which is getting the e-book version. So ,
why not try out this book? Let's view.

Lupe Holloway:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
in addition native or citizen want book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know those



guides have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world.
With the book Nelson's Biographical Dictionary and Historical Reference Book of Erie County,
Pennsylvania; Containing a Condensed History of Pennsylvania, of Erie ... and Townships in the County
Also Portraits we can acquire more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? Being creative person must
choose to read a book. Only choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to
change your life with that book Nelson's Biographical Dictionary and Historical Reference Book of Erie
County, Pennsylvania; Containing a Condensed History of Pennsylvania, of Erie ... and Townships in the
County Also Portraits. You can more inviting than now.
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