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"From class struggle to crass struggle; that is the defining feature of the times. And the genius of today's
political economy has been to convert what used to be a potential life-and-death conflict between haves and
have-nots into a minor disagreement between have-lots and wanna-have-mores." Why do those who are
extremely well off spend their money in socially and environmentally damaging ways? How do crooks, con
artists, and counterfeiters function in the hypercharged markets catering to the whims and fancies of the very
rich? And why do so many of the less fortunate insist on slavishly emulating the über rich, spending way
beyond what their limited means allow? A critique of the lifestyles of today's ultra rich bolstered by old-
fashioned muckraking, Crass Struggle provides a sharp, original, and often humorous commentary on "the
bad side of the good life, the underbelly of the potbelly." Taking the reader inside today's luxury trades, R.T.
Naylor visits gold mines spewing arsenic and diamond fields spreading human misery, knocks on the doors
of purveyors of luxury seafood as the oceans empty, samples wares of merchants offering top-vintage wines
(or at least top-vintage labels), calls on companies running trophy-hunting expeditions and dealers in exotic
pets high on endangered lists, and much more. What stands out is that so many high-priced items glitter on
the outside, but have more than a spot of rot at the core. Through a series of outrageous but all too true
stories, Crass Struggle reveals the appalling consequences of consumerism run amok and its links to
repetitive financial swindles and the alarming degradation of the biophysical environment.
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From reader reviews:

Roberta Swinton:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Crass Struggle: Greed, Glitz, and Gluttony in a Wanna-Have World. Try to
face the book Crass Struggle: Greed, Glitz, and Gluttony in a Wanna-Have World as your pal. It means that
it can for being your friend when you feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than ever.
Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience in addition to knowledge with this
book.

Hayden Wolfe:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading. Sure,
by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to endure than other is high. To suit your
needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Crass Struggle: Greed, Glitz, and Gluttony in a
Wanna-Have World book as starter and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Rochelle Barrick:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
if those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which
one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take Crass Struggle: Greed, Glitz, and Gluttony in a Wanna-
Have World as the daily resource information.

Julia Watkins:

You can obtain this Crass Struggle: Greed, Glitz, and Gluttony in a Wanna-Have World by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve challenge if you get
difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by means of written or printed
but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking by your
local mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more
information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are
still revise. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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