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Understanding Equity and Trusts is a sister text to Alastair Hudson's leading textbook Equity and Trusts, that
gives those unfamiliar with the subject a clear, accessible, readable and comprehensive overview of the main
themes in this dynamic area of the law. Whether used at the beginning of studying this field, as an aid to
study or in the period before examinations, this book provides the reader with an invaluable grounding in all
of the key principles of equity and the law of trusts.

This book covers all of the topics that a student reader will encounter in any trusts law or general equity
course. The text deals with express trusts, resulting and constructive trusts, the duties of trustees, breach of
trust and tracing, commercial uses of trusts, charities, pensions, trusts of homes and equitable remedies.

The third edition has been revised and updated to include new material on investing trusts and trustee’s
duties and the material on charities has been substantially rewritten in the light of the Charities Act 2006.

The law of trusts is built on simple basic principles. The approach of this book is to begin with a clear
presentation of those principles before guiding the reader through the more complex issues which are the
feature of examinations in this subject. The lively text includes a large number of straightforward examples
to make the discussion of the general law more accessible.
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From reader reviews:

Lauren Joseph:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Understanding Equity & Trusts. Try to make the book Understanding
Equity & Trusts as your good friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone and
beside that of course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you
much more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we should make new experience
as well as knowledge with this book.

Michael Griffin:

Here thing why this specific Understanding Equity & Trusts are different and dependable to be yours. First
of all reading through a book is good but it really depends in the content of it which is the content is as
yummy as food or not. Understanding Equity & Trusts giving you information deeper including different
ways, you can find any book out there but there is no reserve that similar with Understanding Equity &
Trusts. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing this happened in the
world which is might be can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in park your
car, café, or even in your method home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the branded
book maybe the form of Understanding Equity & Trusts in e-book can be your option.

Blake Nixon:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but additionally novel and Understanding Equity & Trusts or even others
sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more
and more. Science book was created for teacher or students especially. Those guides are helping them to
increase their knowledge. In various other case, beside science publication, any other book likes
Understanding Equity & Trusts to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

John Stewart:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know that
little person like reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update in relation to something by book. Different categories of
books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this Understanding Equity & Trusts.
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