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In this deeply learned work, Toshihiko Izutsu compares the metaphysical and mystical thought-systems of
Sufism and Taoism and discovers that, although historically unrelated, the two share features and patterns
which prove fruitful for a transhistorical dialogue. His original and suggestive approach opens new doors in
the study of comparative philosophy and mysticism.

Izutsu begins with Ibn 'Arabi, analyzing and isolating the major ontological concepts of this most
challenging of Islamic thinkers. Then, in the second part of the book, Izutsu turns his attention to an analysis
of parallel concepts of two great Taoist thinkers, Lao-tzu and Chuang-tzu. Only after laying bare the
fundamental structure of each world view does Izutsu embark, in the final section of the book, upon a
comparative analysis. Only thus, he argues, can he be sure to avoid easy and superficial comparisons. Izutsu
maintains that both the Sufi and Taoist world views are based on two pivots—the Absolute Man and the
Perfect Man—with a whole system of oncological thought being developed between these two pivots. Izutsu
discusses similarities in these ontological systems and advances the hypothesis that certain patterns of
mystical and metaphysical thought may be shared even by systems with no apparent historical connection.

This second edition of Sufism and Taoism is the first published in the United States. The original edition,
published in English and in Japan, was prized by the few English-speaking scholars who knew of it as a
model in the field of comparative philosophy. Making available in English much new material on both sides
of its comparison, Sufism and Taoism richly fulfills Izutsu's motivating desire "to open a new vista in the
domain of comparative philosophy."
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From reader reviews:

Bryan Smith:

What do you about book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or
woman? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster.
And you have spare time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to answer that
question because just their can do that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Sufism and Taoism: A
Comparative Study of Key Philosophical Concepts to read.

Norma Dickerson:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or data even knowledge to make
all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This Sufism and Taoism: A
Comparative Study of Key Philosophical Concepts is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the
world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Patrick Taylor:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title Sufism and
Taoism: A Comparative Study of Key Philosophical Concepts suitable to you? The particular book was
written by popular writer in this era. Typically the book untitled Sufism and Taoism: A Comparative Study
of Key Philosophical Conceptsis the main one of several books that everyone read now. This specific book
was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new shape that you
ever know prior to. The author explained their concept in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to be
aware of the core of this guide. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now.
To help you to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Nancy Byrom:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specially book entitled
Sufism and Taoism: A Comparative Study of Key Philosophical Concepts the mind will drift away trough
every dimension, wandering in each and every aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely might be your
mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a publication then become one form conclusion and
explanation that maybe you never get prior to. The Sufism and Taoism: A Comparative Study of Key
Philosophical Concepts giving you one more experience more than blown away your head but also giving
you useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern the
following is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning an



activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?
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