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Sin Trompo de Poner es un libro original que atrapa al lector. . . Desde el título, Paul Paniagua nos penetra
en un espacio lúdico, inspirado en los juegos de trompos. Para el autor, el texto es una metáfora de la vida. . .
Estos textos hiperbreves no se pueden leer con el ceño fruncido, sino con una amplia sonrisa. El autor se
inspira en la toalla del baño, a la que denuncia públicamente por ser infiel. Por otro lado, el inodoro sufre y
acepta estoicamente su destino. Los textos de Paniagua indagan lo más simple de la humanidad,
descubriendo misterios y mirando la vida con una óptica diferente. Así, los escritos de Paul Paniagua,
subliman el espíritu, conquistan la alegría, y nos hacen ver la vida con humor y optimismo. Dra. Mara L.
García.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Elam:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a move, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book titled Sin
trompo de poner (Spanish Edition)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You know beside you can spend
your time with the favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have
different opinion?

David Simpson:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great and also important the book Sin trompo de poner (Spanish
Edition). All type of book are you able to see on many methods. You can look for the internet sources or
other social media.

Jane Pelley:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving Sin trompo de poner (Spanish
Edition) that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading habit all
over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world better then how they react to the
world. It can't be said constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you
who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your good habit,
you can pick Sin trompo de poner (Spanish Edition) become your starter.

Vickie Duke:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book. Ugh, ya think
reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you can have the e-
book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Sin trompo de poner (Spanish Edition) which
is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.
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