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A groundbreaking look at the connection between germs and mental illness, and how we can protect
ourselves.

Is it possible to catch autism or OCD the same way we catch the flu? Can a child's contact with cat litter lead
to schizophrenia? In her eye-opening new book, National Book Critics Circle Award-winning author Harriet
Washington reveals that we can in fact "catch" mental illness. In INFECTIOUS MADNESS, Washington
presents the new germ theory, which posits not only that many instances of Alzheimer's, OCD, and
schizophrenia are caused by viruses, prions, and bacteria, but also that with antibiotics, vaccinations, and
other strategies, these cases can be easily prevented or treated. Packed with cutting-edge research and
tantalizing mysteries, INFECTIOUS MADNESS is rich in science, characters, and practical advice on how
to protect yourself and your children from exposure to infectious threats that could sabotage your mental and
physical health.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Maples:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Infectious Madness: The Surprising Science of How We
"Catch" Mental Illness. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about
how is important the book Infectious Madness: The Surprising Science of How We "Catch" Mental Illness.
You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can understand everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you can be
known. About simple point until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we are able to open a
book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to
the library. Let's study.

Alicia Mendes:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of several ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to
definitely imagine the story how the people do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to some
others. When you read this Infectious Madness: The Surprising Science of How We "Catch" Mental Illness,
you can tells your family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the
others, make them reading a guide.

Edward Gilbert:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This publication Infectious Madness: The Surprising Science of How We
"Catch" Mental Illness was filled concerning science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about
your research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know
how big benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like currently,
many ways to get book which you wanted.

Earnest Koontz:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update of
news. On this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just in
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