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With nearly two-thirds of global electricity consumed by electric motors, it should come as no surprise that
their proper control represents appreciable energy savings. The efficient use of electric drives also has far-
reaching applications in such areas as factory automation (robotics), clean transportation (hybrid-electric
vehicles), and renewable (wind and solar) energy resource management. Advanced Electric Drives utilizes a
physics-based approach to explain the fundamental concepts of modern electric drive control and its
operation under dynamic conditions. Author Ned Mohan, a decades-long leader in Electrical Energy Systems
(EES) education and research, reveals how the investment of proper controls, advanced MATLAB and
Simulink simulations, and careful forethought in the design of energy systems translates to significant
savings in energy and dollars. Offering students a fresh alternative to standard mathematical treatments of
dq-axis transformation of a-b-c phase quantities, Mohan’s unique physics-based approach “visualizes” a set
of representative dq windings along an orthogonal set of axes and then relates their currents and voltages to
the a-b-c phase quantities. Advanced Electric Drives is an invaluable resource to facilitate an understanding
of the analysis, control, and modelling of electric machines.

• Gives readers a “physical” picture of electric machines and drives without resorting to mathematical
transformations for easy visualization

• Confirms the physics-based analysis of electric drives mathematically

• Provides readers with an analysis of electric machines in a way that can be easily interfaced to common
power electronic converters and controlled using any control scheme

• Makes the MATLAB/Simulink files used in examples available to anyone in an accompanying website

• Reinforces fundamentals with a variety of discussion questions, concept quizzes, and homework problems
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From reader reviews:

Carla Smith:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information currently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider
when those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously which
one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Advanced Electric Drives: Analysis, Control, and
Modeling Using MATLAB / Simulink as the daily resource information.

Elizabeth Hager:

Typically the book Advanced Electric Drives: Analysis, Control, and Modeling Using MATLAB / Simulink
will bring you to the new experience of reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique.
If you try to find new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Advanced Electric Drives:
Analysis, Control, and Modeling Using MATLAB / Simulink is much recommended to you to learn. You
can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Sharyl Nettles:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find guide that
need more time to be learn. Advanced Electric Drives: Analysis, Control, and Modeling Using MATLAB /
Simulink can be your answer given it can be read by you who have those short free time problems.

Al Fraire:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book Advanced Electric Drives: Analysis, Control,
and Modeling Using MATLAB / Simulink to make your reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is
developing when you including reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle
the opinion about book and studying especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a book
and examine it. Beside that the book Advanced Electric Drives: Analysis, Control, and Modeling Using
MATLAB / Simulink can to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse in doing what must
you're doing of that time.
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