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Robin Pilcher, bestselling author of An Ocean Apart returns readers to contemporary Scotland, where the
"simple" life has grown somewhat more complicated, but the shortest distance between lonely hearts will
always be love...

Sometimes The Hardest Thing In Life...
Liz Dewhurst has witnessed quite a bit in her thirty-seven years: the birth of her son, the death of her mother,
the waxing and waning days on the farm where she was raised...the sight of her husband in another woman's
arms. Suddenly, she's feeling worn down and used up by the very lifestyle upon which she once thrived.
Bitterness at her broken marriage has distanced her from her son, Alex-even as she's poured all her
remaining energy into battling the development company that wants to purchase her family's land to build a
golf course.

...Is To Live It
Now Liz must confront a few things, including the fate of the farm, her feelings for her ex-husband, and a
trip to Spain that rekindles a fire in her she had forgotten existed. The Liz who returns to Balmuir is a
different woman. Now, in the wake of a near-tragedy, she must draw on her newfound strength to make a
difficult choice. To look at her life in a different way, standing tall, and...
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From reader reviews:

Walter Berry:

The experience that you get from Starting Over could be the more deep you rooting the information that hide
within the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
understand but Starting Over giving you buzz feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in a number
of way that can be understood by anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve is well-known
enough. This particular book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to
understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for
having this specific Starting Over instantly.

Burton Zinn:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Starting Over publication written by
well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who read the
book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your
own hunger then you still uncertainty Starting Over as good book not just by the cover but also by content.
This is one publication that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing yet another
sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to yet another sixth sense.

Ronald Griffin:

The book untitled Starting Over contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains your girlfriend
idea with easy technique. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not really worry, you can
easy to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author will bring you in the new period
of time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or
gadget, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open
their official web-site and order it. Have a nice study.

Rochelle Barrick:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Starting Over was multi-colored and of course has
pictures on there. As we know that book Starting Over has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
adolescents. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on
there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the
best book for you and try to like reading that will.
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