
Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics,
Philosophy, and Literature

Peter Pesic

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=026266173X
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=026266173X
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=026266173X


Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and
Literature

Peter Pesic

Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and Literature Peter Pesic

The separateness and connection of individuals is perhaps the central question of human life: What, exactly,
is my individuality? To what degree is it unique? To what degree can it be shared, and how? To the many
philosophical and literary speculations about these topics over time, modern science has added the curious
twist of quantum theory, which requires that the elementary particles of which everything consists have no
individuality at all. All aspects of chemistry depend on this lack of individuality, as do many branches of
physics. From where, then, does our individuality come?In Seeing Double, Peter Pesic invites readers to
explore this intriguing set of questions. He draws on literary and historical examples that open the mind
(from Homer to Martin Guerre to Kafka), philosophical analyses that have helped to make our thinking and
speech more precise, and scientific work that has enabled us to characterize the phenomena of nature.
Though he does not try to be all-inclusive, Pesic presents a broad range of ideas, building toward a specific
point of view: that the crux of modern quantum theory is its clash with our ordinary concept of individuality.
This represents a departure from the usual understanding of quantum theory. Pesic argues that what is bizarre
about quantum theory becomes more intelligible as we reconsider what we mean by individuality and
identity in ordinary experience. In turn, quantum identity opens a new perspective on us.
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From reader reviews:

James Alvarez:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, person feel need book once they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and
Literature.

Walter Crouse:

This Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and Literature book is absolutely not ordinary
book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is actually
information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person read a lot of
information you will get. This specific Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and
Literature without we know teach the one who reading through it become critical in considering and
analyzing. Don't become worry Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and Literature can
bring once you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it
in your lovely laptop even telephone. This Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and
Literature having very good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Dina Hirsch:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This reserve Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and Literature was
filled about science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.
Some people has several feel when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you
can feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.

Cynthia Barksdale:

Reserve is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. By book Seeing Double: Shared Identities in Physics, Philosophy, and Literature we can consider
more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? Being creative person must want to read a book. Merely
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life by this book
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