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Memory of Brother GEORGE WASHINGTON; raised to the ALL PERFECT LODGE Dec. 14, 5799.--Ripe
in years and full of glory." For many years this urn was sacredly cared for. On the 13th of March, 1S09, the
Masons appointed a committee to "examine the Urn &c. procured by the Grand Lodge as a testimony of their
Veneration for the exalted character, and example of their Illustrious Brother, and Patron, George
Washington, Esq. Deceased; and to enquire if a suitable place could be appropriated for it in Mason's Hall."
That committee reported that they had " visited the House of R. W. Paul Revere Esq. Past Grand Master, and
find that the most scrupulous care had been observed in the preservation of the Urn and its appendages: They
also find that the most proper place for them in the Hall is directly over the Chair of the M. W. Grand
Master;"1 and the following communication was sent at this time: "Boston, March 15, 18o9. "R. W. Paul
Revere, Esq. "The following Resolve passed the Grand Lodge the last quarterly Communication, I with
pleasure transmit you; also our last printed Circular and remain with great personal respect and Brotherly
affection yours, "john Proctor "Gd Secretary. 1 Records of the Grand Lodge. "Resolved--that the thanks of
the Grand Lodge be given to the Right W. Paul Revere Esq Past Grand Master, for the care he has hitherto
taken of the Urn & its appendages, used at the Funeral procession of our Most Worthy and Revered R. W.
Brother George Washington Esq. Deceased; and that he be requested to permit them to remain under his
protection, until the Grand Lodge shall have it in their power otherwise to dispose of them. "Attest John
Proctor G. Secy." 1 1 From family papers. CHA...
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From reader reviews:

Derek Morton:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
kind of aren't like that. This The Life of Colonel Paul Revere,: V. 1 book is readable through you who hate
those straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without
leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer connected with The Life of
Colonel Paul Revere,: V. 1 content conveys the idea easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and
e-book are not different in the content material but it just different in the form of it. So , do you still thinking
The Life of Colonel Paul Revere,: V. 1 is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Barbara Figueroa:

This The Life of Colonel Paul Revere,: V. 1 is great e-book for you because the content which is full of
information for you who else always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This kind
of book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we can claim no rambling sentences in it. So
if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you
straight forward sentences but hard core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having The Life of
Colonel Paul Revere,: V. 1 in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous a
single. We can say that no reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this reserve
already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt this?

Frank Godwin:

The book untitled The Life of Colonel Paul Revere,: V. 1 contain a lot of information on that. The writer
explains her idea with easy way. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not worry, you
can easy to read this. The book was published by famous author. The author brings you in the new period of
time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-
book, you can open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice study.

Willie Adams:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social such as
newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just looking
for the The Life of Colonel Paul Revere,: V. 1 when you desired it?
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