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Employers look for two things when hiring or promoting people: knowledge and skill. They rarely, if ever,
consider character. Yet character is the key to extraordinary business success. The Good Ones presents ten
crucial qualities of high-character employees, qualities that enhance employee satisfaction, client
relationships, and the bottom line.

You’ll read stories from managers and employees across the U.S. and beyond who reveal how honesty,
courage, loyalty, and patience have helped their organizations maintain an edge over the competition. Each
chapter is devoted to a single quality of character and ends with questions employers can use to hire and
promote the Good Ones — people who are consistently honest, accountable, fair, and grateful.

Whether you’re looking to bring new people into your organization or seeking a job or promotion yourself,
The Good Ones will help you appreciate in practical terms why character is the missing link to excellence.
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From reader reviews:

Johanna Garrett:

Do you considered one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys that aren't like that. This The Good Ones: Ten Crucial Qualities of High-Character Employees
book is readable by means of you who hate the straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange
for enjoyable examining experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to
you. The writer of The Good Ones: Ten Crucial Qualities of High-Character Employees content conveys
objective easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written
content but it just different as it. So , do you continue to thinking The Good Ones: Ten Crucial Qualities of
High-Character Employees is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Phyllis Thompson:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer can be The Good Ones: Ten Crucial Qualities of High-Character Employees
why because the amazing cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint anyone. The
inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
show you to pick up this book.

John Hagen:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find guide that need
more time to be study. The Good Ones: Ten Crucial Qualities of High-Character Employees can be your
answer as it can be read by you actually who have those short spare time problems.

Sharon Works:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's internal or
real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this The Good Ones: Ten Crucial Qualities of High-Character Employees can make you feel more
interested to read.
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