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In her previous novels, Michelle Cliff explored potent themes of colonialism, race, myth, and identity with
rare intelligence, lyrical intensity, and a profound sense of both history and place. Now, with Into the
Interior, she has written her most intimate, courageous work of fiction yet, a searing and ultimately moving
reflection on the legacy of empire and the restless search for a feeling of belonging.
 
“I grew up to be someone adept at leaving,” confesses Into the Interior’s unnamed narrator, a bisexual
Caribbean woman of color, and Cliff traces her travels from Jamaica to New York to London. Educated in
admiration for Western culture—she goes to London to study art history—she penetrates further and further
into its emotional shadow life in an attempt to overcome her own deep sense of displacement. Reversing the
journey Joseph Conrad’s Marlow took from the imperial capital to a colonial outpost, she discovers a “heart
of darkness” in the former capital of the British Empire. Moving among its fragmented personalities and
social life, she witnesses—and experiences—its propensity for racism and homophobia, misogyny and
abusive patriarchy, hypocrisy and sadism.
 
Deftly shifting between present and past, between a childhood in Jamaica—her memories, both disconcerting
and humor-tinged, beautifully rendered by Cliff’s elliptical prose—and her purposeful wanderings as an
adult that result in intellectual, sexual, and political awakenings, Into the Interior is both deeply personal and
charged by a world-historical awareness of the persistent injustices that colonialism imposes on its former
subjects.
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From reader reviews:

Roger Ruelas:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book Into the Interior. You can choose the best book if you'd
prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book Into the Interior. You can add
knowledge and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from book you
can realize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we could open a book or maybe searching
by internet device. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's
study.

Natalie White:

The book Into the Interior give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make
your capable considerably more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting stress or having
big problem with your subject. If you can make looking at a book Into the Interior to be your habit, you can
get considerably more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about several or all
subjects. You are able to know everything if you like start and read a guide Into the Interior. Kinds of book
are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-
book?

James Buscher:

The book Into the Interior can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave the great thing like a book Into the Interior? A few of you
have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many details for us. It is absolutely
appropriate. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you
may give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Into the Interior has simple shape however, you
know: it has great and massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by wide open and read a
e-book. So it is very wonderful.

James Sanford:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you this Into the Interior book as
beginner and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.
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