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The memory feats of famous musicians seem almost superhuman. Can such extraordinary accomplishments
be explained by the same principles that account for more ordinary, everyday memory abilities? To find out,
a concert pianist videotaped her practice as she learned a new piece for performance, the third movement,
Presto, of the Italian Concerto by J.S. Bach. The story of how the pianist went about learning, memorizing
and polishing the piece is told from the viewpoints of the pianist (the second author) and of a cognitive
psychologist (the first author) observing the practice. The counterpoint between these insider and outsider
perspectives is framed by the observations of a social psychologist (the third author) about how the two
viewpoints were reconciled. The CD that accompanies the book provides for yet another perspective,
allowing the reader to hear the polished performance.

Written for both psychologists and musicians, the book provides the first detailed description of how an
experienced pianist organizes her practice, identifying stages of the learning process, characteristics of expert
practice, and practice strategies. The main focus, however, is on memorization. An analysis of what
prominent pianists of the past century have said about memorization reveals considerable disagreement and
confusion. Using previous work on expert memory as a starting point, the authors show how principles of
memory developed by cognitive psychologists apply to musical performance and uncover the intimate
connection between memorization and interpretation.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Henricks:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
walk, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled Practicing Perfection:
Memory and Piano Performance (Expertise: Research and Applications Series)? Maybe it is to become best
activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have different opinion?

Donna Kerns:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading a book can
help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Practicing Perfection: Memory and Piano
Performance (Expertise: Research and Applications Series) book because this book offers you rich info and
knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Sergio Espinoza:

The knowledge that you get from Practicing Perfection: Memory and Piano Performance (Expertise:
Research and Applications Series) may be the more deep you looking the information that hide within the
words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but
Practicing Perfection: Memory and Piano Performance (Expertise: Research and Applications Series) giving
you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood
through anyone who read that because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This particular book
also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go along with
you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this particular Practicing
Perfection: Memory and Piano Performance (Expertise: Research and Applications Series) instantly.

Maria Simmons:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the name Practicing Perfection:
Memory and Piano Performance (Expertise: Research and Applications Series) suitable to you? The
particular book was written by famous writer in this era. The particular book untitled Practicing Perfection:
Memory and Piano Performance (Expertise: Research and Applications Series)is one of several books that
everyone read now. This book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this publication you
will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know previous to. The author explained their plan in the
simple way, therefore all of people can easily to know the core of this book. This book will give you a wide
range of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world with this book.
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