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Lady Gillian MacLennan's clan needs a leader, but the last person on earth she wants as their laird is Fingal
Maclan. She can neither forgive nor forget that his mother killed her father, and, by doing so, created Clan
MacLennan's current desperate circumstances. 
King David knows a weak clan, without a laird, can change quickly from a simple annoyance to a dangerous
liability, and he cannot ignore the turmoil. The MacIan's owe him a great debt, so when he makes Fingal
MacIan laird of clan MacLennan and requires that he marry Lady Gillian, Fingal is in no position to refuse. 
In spite of the challenge, Fingal is confident he can rebuild her clan, ease her heartache and win her
affection. However, just as love awakens, the power struggle takes a deadly turn. Can he protect her from the
unknown long enough to uncover the plot against them? Or will all be lost, destroying the happiness they
seek in each other's arms?
Each book in the Duncurra series stands alone. The author recommends reading Highland Solution first but
books 2 and 3 can be read in any order.
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From reader reviews:

Dale Moore:

The book Highland Intrigue (Duncurra) (Volume 3) make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You should use
to make your capable more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting tension or
having big problem using your subject. If you can make studying a book Highland Intrigue (Duncurra)
(Volume 3) being your habit, you can get much more advantages, like add your own personal capable,
increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and
read a guide Highland Intrigue (Duncurra) (Volume 3). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-
book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this guide?

Josette Leonard:

The guide untitled Highland Intrigue (Duncurra) (Volume 3) is the guide that recommended to you to see.
You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that creator use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of analysis when write the book,
therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-
book of Highland Intrigue (Duncurra) (Volume 3) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Larry Huff:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Highland Intrigue (Duncurra)
(Volume 3) can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date,
spending your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks
have than the others?

Kyle Cook:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This book Highland Intrigue (Duncurra) (Volume 3) was filled in relation to science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has
different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can
experience enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you just
wanted.
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