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"I believe each of my students must craft an individual reading life of challenge, whim, curiosity, and
hunger, and I've discovered that it is not too late in high school to lead a non-reader to reading. It's never
too late."-Penny Kittle

Penny Kittle wants us to face the hard truths every English teacher fears: too many kids don't read the
assigned texts, and some even manage to slip by without having ever read a single book by the time they
graduate. As middle and high school reading declines, college professors lament students' inability to
comprehend and analyze complex texts, while the rest of us wonder: what do we lose as a society when so
many of our high school graduates have no interest in reading anything?
 In Book Love Penny takes student apathy head on, first by recognizing why students don't read and then
showing us that when we give kids books that are right for them, along with time to read and regular
response to their thinking, we can create a pathway to satisfying reading that leads to more challenging
literature and ultimately, a love of reading.
 With a clear eye on the reality of today's classrooms, Penny provides practical strategies and advice on:

increasing volume, capacity, and complexity over time●

creating a balance of independent reading, text study, and novel study●

helping students deepen their thinking through writing about reading●

building a classroom library with themes that matter to 21st century kids.●

Book Love is a call to arms for putting every single kid, no exceptions allowed, on a personal reading
journey. But much more than that, it's a powerful reminder of why we became English teachers in the first
place: our passion for books. Books matter. Stories heal. The right book in the hands of a kid can change a
life forever. We can't wait for anyone else to teach our students a love of books-it's up to us and the time is
now. If not you, who?
 For information about the Book Love Foundation, which provides classroom libraries to deserving teachers
and schools, visit booklovefoundation.org.
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From reader reviews:

Teresa Dillard:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained within the straightway,
hold on guys this kind of aren't like that. This Book Love: Developing Depth, Stamina, and Passion in
Adolescent Readers book is readable simply by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the info
here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that
want to provide to you. The writer associated with Book Love: Developing Depth, Stamina, and Passion in
Adolescent Readers content conveys the thought easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-
book are not different in the content material but it just different by means of it. So , do you even now
thinking Book Love: Developing Depth, Stamina, and Passion in Adolescent Readers is not loveable to be
your top record reading book?

Juanita Geil:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, examining a book will make you more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how
the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
Book Love: Developing Depth, Stamina, and Passion in Adolescent Readers, you may tells your family,
friends along with soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a
publication.

Mamie Contreras:

This Book Love: Developing Depth, Stamina, and Passion in Adolescent Readers is great e-book for you
because the content and that is full of information for you who else always deal with world and still have to
make decision every minute. This book reveal it details accurately using great organize word or we can point
out no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole information in it.
Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering
sentences. Having Book Love: Developing Depth, Stamina, and Passion in Adolescent Readers in your hand
like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no
publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this guide already do that. So , this can
be good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that will?

Karin Decker:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that query was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you know that



little person like reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very important
and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge, except your own teacher
or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. Different categories of books
that can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims Book Love: Developing Depth, Stamina,
and Passion in Adolescent Readers.
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