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Who are the Serbs? Branded by some as Europe's new Nazis, they are seen by others—and by
themselves—as the innocent victims of nationalist aggression and of an implacably hostile world media. In
this challenging new book, Timothy Judah, who covered the war years in former Yugoslavia for the London
Times and the Economist, argues that neither is true. Exploring the Serbian nation from the great epics of its
past to the battlefields of Bosnia and the backstreets of Kosovo, he sets the fate of the Serbs within the story
of their past.

This wide-ranging, scholarly, and highly readable account opens with the windswept fortresses of medieval
kings and a battle lost more than six centuries ago that still profoundly influences the Serbs. Judah describes
the idea of "Serbdom" that sustained them during centuries of Ottoman rule, the days of glory during the
First World War, and the genocide against them during the Second. He examines the tenuous ethnic balance
fashioned by Tito and its unraveling after his death. And he reveals how Slobodan Milosevic, later to become
president, used a version of history to drive his people to nationalist euphoria. Judah details the way
Milosevic prepared for war and provides gripping eyewitness accounts of wartime horrors: the burning
villages and "ethnic cleansing," the ignominy of the siege of Sarajevo, and the columns of bedraggled Serb
refugees, cynically manipulated and then abandoned once the dream of a Greater Serbia was lost.

This first in-depth account of life behind Serbian lines is not an apologia but a scrupulous explanation of how
the people of a modernizing European state could become among the most reviled of the century. Rejecting
the stereotypical image of a bloodthirsty nation, Judah makes the Serbs comprehensible by placing them
within the context of their history and their hopes.
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From reader reviews:

Cecil Hardin:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important usually. The book The Serbs: History, Myth and the Destruction of Yugoslavia,
Second Edition (Yale Nota Bene) had been making you to know about other understanding and of course
you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The publication The Serbs: History, Myth
and the Destruction of Yugoslavia, Second Edition (Yale Nota Bene) is not only giving you far more new
information but also for being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your personal spend time to
read your e-book. Try to make relationship using the book The Serbs: History, Myth and the Destruction of
Yugoslavia, Second Edition (Yale Nota Bene). You never truly feel lose out for everything in case you read
some books.

Ralph Scott:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their particular reader with their story
or perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the data
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their
skill in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this The Serbs:
History, Myth and the Destruction of Yugoslavia, Second Edition (Yale Nota Bene).

Ellis Dunn:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read a book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24
hours a day to reading a reserve. The book The Serbs: History, Myth and the Destruction of Yugoslavia,
Second Edition (Yale Nota Bene) it is quite good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this
book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to deliver this
book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from a smart phone. The
price is not too expensive but this book offers high quality.

Ryan Fox:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this The Serbs: History, Myth and the Destruction
of Yugoslavia, Second Edition (Yale Nota Bene) publication written by well-known writer we are excited for
well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who read the book. Written throughout good



manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own personal
hunger then you still uncertainty The Serbs: History, Myth and the Destruction of Yugoslavia, Second
Edition (Yale Nota Bene) as good book not just by the cover but also by content. This is one book that can
break don't assess book by its cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh
come on your examining sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.
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