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In the summer of 1925, the sleepy hamlet of Dayton, Tennessee, became the setting for one of the 20th
century’s most contentious dramas: the Scopes trial that pit William Jennings Bryan and the anti-Darwinists
against a teacher named John Scopes into a famous debate over science, religion, and their place in public
education That trial marked the start of a battle that continues to this day-in Dover, Pennsylvania, Kansas,
Cobb County, Georgia, and many other cities and states throughout the country. Edward Larson’s classic,
Summer for the Gods, received the Pulitzer Prize in History in 1998 and is the single most authoritative
account of a pivotal event whose combatants remain at odds in school districts and courtrooms. For this
edition, Larson has added a new preface that assesses the state of the battle between creationism and
evolution, and points the way to how it might potentially be resolved.
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From reader reviews:

Hilda Baker:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information today can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take Summer for the Gods: The Scopes Trial and America's
Continuing Debate Over Science and Religion as the daily resource information.

Teresa Spillman:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
lot of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have when the
spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading
ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the book you have read is actually Summer
for the Gods: The Scopes Trial and America's Continuing Debate Over Science and Religion.

Peter Chatman:

Summer for the Gods: The Scopes Trial and America's Continuing Debate Over Science and Religion can be
one of your beginner books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this guide
has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
still delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to place every word into enjoyment
arrangement in writing Summer for the Gods: The Scopes Trial and America's Continuing Debate Over
Science and Religion however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest along with based
confirm resource info that maybe you can be one among it. This great information may drawn you into
brand-new stage of crucial imagining.

Kristi Duncan:

Reading a book being new life style in this yr; every people loves to examine a book. When you learn a book
you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, since book has
a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you have
read. If you want to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The Summer for the
Gods: The Scopes Trial and America's Continuing Debate Over Science and Religion will give you a new
experience in studying a book.
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