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"Sacco brings the conflict down to the most human level, allowing us to imagine our way inside it, to
make the desperation he discovers, in some small way, our own."?Los Angeles Times

Rafah, a town at the bottommost tip of the Gaza Strip, has long been a notorious flashpoint in the bitter
Middle East conflict. Buried deep in the archives is one bloody incident, in 1956, that left 111 Palestinians
shot dead by Israeli soldiers. Seemingly a footnote to a long history of killing, that day in Rafah?cold-
blooded massacre or dreadful mistake?reveals the competing truths that have come to define an intractable
war.

In a quest to get to the heart of what happened, Joe Sacco immerses himself in the daily life of Rafah and the
neighboring town of Khan Younis, uncovering Gaza past and present. As in Palestine and Safe Area
Goražde, his unique visual journalism renders a contested landscape in brilliant, meticulous detail. Spanning
fifty years, moving fluidly between one war and the next, Footnotes in Gaza?Sacco's most ambitious work to
date?transforms a critical conflict of our age into intimate and immediate experience.
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From reader reviews:

Bernice Fugate:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a wander,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book titled Footnotes in Gaza: A
Graphic Novel? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time along with
your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different opinion?

John Lopez:

This book untitled Footnotes in Gaza: A Graphic Novel to be one of several books that best seller in this
year, honestly, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will
easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it through online. The publisher of
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read this book in your
Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this book from your list.

Dennis Ross:

The guide untitled Footnotes in Gaza: A Graphic Novel is the publication that recommended to you to see.
You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to a person. The language that author use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of
exploration when write the book, so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also
could get the e-book of Footnotes in Gaza: A Graphic Novel from the publisher to make you more enjoy free
time.

Lynda Alford:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find book that need more time to be read.
Footnotes in Gaza: A Graphic Novel can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you actually who
have those short extra time problems.
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