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"Last night Mel and I were talking about some of the adjustments we'll have to make to our husbands' return.
I must admit I'm not exactly the same girl you left-I'm twice as independent as I used to be and to top it off, I
sometimes think I've become 'hard as nails'. . . . Also--more and more I've been living exactly as I want to . .
. I do as I damn please."

[These tough words from the wife of a soldier show that World War Ii changed much more than just
international politics.]

"From a fascinating collection of letters, filled with wonderfully distinctive human stories, Judy Barrett
Litoff and David C. Smith have shpaed a rare and brilliant book that transports the reader back in time to an
unforgettable era."--Doris Kearns Goodwin, author of The Fitzgeralds and the Kennedys and Lyndon
Johnson and the American Dream.

"This is a wonderful volume, full of admirable women struggling in a difficult situation, doing their best for
their families and their country. Ah, the memories it brings back! Highly recommended for those who lived
through the war, and for those who want to understand it."--Stephen E. Ambrose, author of Eisenhower and
D-Day, June 6, 1944

"Offering a remarkable view into the lives of ordinary women during wartime, this book will enlighten and
catch at the hearts of general readers and cause historians to reconsider how women experienced World War
II."-Susan M. Hartmann, author of The Home Front and Beyond.

"From among 25,000 of an estimated six billion letters sent overseas during World War II, Litoff and Smith
have culled and skillfully edited a sampling by 400 American women. These letters, starting with one to a
seaman wounded at Pearl Harbor, are compelling documents of home-front life in varied ethnic, cultural, and
financial milieus. Tragic, touching, and funny, the correspondence is full of prosaic news and gossip about
jobs and neighbors, along with accounts of births and intimate allusions to love-making. The stress of
separation was intensified for women whose loved ones were hospitalized, or imprisoned as either
conscientious objectors or security risks. Some women wrote General MacArthur and others for news of
missing men or to obtain details of their deaths. Many of these heartrending documents also express
acceptance-and even pride-in the sacrifices required by war."--Publishers Weekly.

"Other scholars of WW II have published letters written home by servicemen, but this is the first collection
sampling the letters written by sisters, sweethearts, wives, and mothers, saved by thousands of servicemen.
Chapters are organized around themes that were important to these women: courtship, marriage,
motherhood, work, sacrifices. . . . What women tell readers in these letters about their concerns and their
wartime feelings will cause historians [readers?] to rethink what has been written about the
homefront."--Choice.

"Despite the popular appeal of Rosie the Riveter, nine out of ten mothers with children under six were not in
the labor force, which helps to account for the vast outpouring of mail from the home front to 'our boys' in
the European and Pacific theaters. Some couples wrote every day for four years. This is the rich historic



documentation that the authors have drawn upon to create a panoramic pastiche of indefatigable, energetic,
patriotic female letter writers in the war years. . . . One is struck by the hard-headed practicality of many of
the letters-stories of plucky, sometimes even grumpy, coping. There are letters of growing independence,
with strong and at times explicit indication that the boyfriend or husband will be facing a very different
woman upon his return from the one he 'knew' when he disembarked for his own, often terrible, venture. .
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From reader reviews:

Hyacinth Mills:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book called Since
You Went Away: World War II Letters from American Women on the Home Front? Maybe it is to get best
activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have various other opinion?

Dave Edwards:

The event that you get from Since You Went Away: World War II Letters from American Women on the
Home Front could be the more deep you searching the information that hide into the words the more you get
enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Since You Went
Away: World War II Letters from American Women on the Home Front giving you joy feeling of reading.
The copy writer conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by anyone who read the idea
because the author of this publication is well-known enough. That book also makes your own personal
vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We propose you for having this particular Since You Went Away: World War II Letters from
American Women on the Home Front instantly.

Jose Jones:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Since You Went Away: World War II Letters from
American Women on the Home Front as the daily resource information.

Raymond Brown:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you may have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition details. Even you love Since You Went Away: World War II
Letters from American Women on the Home Front, you can enjoy both. It is excellent combination right,
you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still
don't buy it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.
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