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There will always be crime.

There will always be those who covet what others possess, or who are driven to acts of violence through rage
or cynical design. And there will always be those who seek justice for those crimes. Yet justice is in the eye
of the beholder, and rarely does it come easy.

A bounty hunter, whose own freedom depends on him finding those who must have theirs taken away, never
asks why. Or what will happen to those he captures. But when he is sent back to his home planet to hunt a
child and her family, he must confront the horror of his past and question whether he can ever truly be free.

A woman holds a gun to a man’s head, getting ready to pull the trigger. But her story doesn’t start there. It
starts way back when she was a kid, in outback Australia. It starts when the government began to put bombs
in people’s heads. When they started toying with probability-based punishment. Now, when she pulls that
trigger, she doesn’t know if he’ll live or die. Or live and die.

In the near future, where the internet has evolved into the Mind, and become so complex that content is
served preprocessed and digested by personal assistant AIs, independent thought is a thing of the past, a
crime even. When insurgents appear, persuading people to see the truth, a police captain begins to question
where her allegiance truly lies.

A young woman who has lost everything but her soul fights to reclaim her life from a violent, sadistic
criminal. But when she’s given a chance for freedom, she realises escape is not enough. First, a just
punishment must be exacted for crimes committed.

Eight stories that push the boundaries of what justice the future holds by some of the most exciting new
speculative fiction authors writing today.
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From reader reviews:

Ella Jacobs:

The book Crime and Punishment: A Speculative Fiction Anthology make you feel enjoy for your spare time.
You should use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book Crime and Punishment:
A Speculative Fiction Anthology for being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own
personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if
you like available and read a reserve Crime and Punishment: A Speculative Fiction Anthology. Kinds of
book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about
this reserve?

Jeff Jaco:

The book Crime and Punishment: A Speculative Fiction Anthology will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book to see, this book very suited to you. The book Crime and Punishment: A Speculative Fiction Anthology
is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Eleanor Sotomayor:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you study
a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. If you want to get information about your examine, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and
soon. The Crime and Punishment: A Speculative Fiction Anthology will give you new experience in reading
through a book.

Bobby Gonsalves:

Is it a person who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Crime and Punishment: A Speculative Fiction
Anthology can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are therefore out of date,
spending your time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks
have than the others?
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